
Grace Church Missionary Profiles 

 

Dwight & Ginny 

Sharp 

 

18 E. Hill St. 
Liberty, PA  16930 
 
D: 570-494-6320 G: 570-494-6978 
dwight_sharp@ntm.org 

 
 
Dwight:  5/28    Ginny: 7/21  
Anniv: 8/14/65 
Timothy, Daniel, Dawn 
 

New Tribes Mission  
 

Supported by Grace since 1973 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Ginny and Dwight met at Moody and were 
married in 1965.  After completing the New 
Tribes Mission training in 1972 they left with 
their four children for Indonesia in 1973.  They 
worked in West Kalimantan with the Embaloh 
people until 1996. After the New and part of 
the Old Testament were translated and the 
Church was established, the Sharps moved to 
the Philippines.   Ginny had already been the 
field Translation Consultant for 15 years.  They 
lived in the Philippines and worked with the 
Tala-Andig people in Mindanao for a number 
of years before moving to the coastal city of 
Butuan.   

In 2009, the Sharps returned to the US to 
minister to their family.  Ginny continues to 
work as a Translation Consultant, planning to 
return to the field twice a year to check 
translations and help train new 
consultants.  Dwight is active in jail ministry 
and they also are busy caring for their 
grandchildren. 
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